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Matthew 22:35-38

35 Then one of them, a lawyer, asked Him a question, 
testing Him, and saying, 

36 "Teacher, which is the great commandment in the 
law?" 

37 Jesus said to him, "'You shall love the Lord your God 
with all your heart, with all your soul, and with all your 

mind.'  

38 This is the first and great commandment. 



Putting First Things First



Living For God



Galatians 5:16-17, 22-24

16 I say then: Walk in the Spirit, and you shall not fulfill 
the lust of the flesh. 

17 For the flesh lusts against the Spirit, and the Spirit 
against the flesh; and these are contrary to one another, 

so that you do not do the things that you wish.

22 But the fruit of the Spirit is love, joy, peace, 
longsuffering, kindness, goodness, faithfulness, 

23 gentleness, self-control. Against such there is no law. 

24 And those who are Christ's have crucified the flesh 
with its passions and desires. 



Romans 8:2, 5-7

2 For the law of the Spirit of life in Christ Jesus has made 
me free from the law of sin and death.

5 For those who live according to the flesh set their 
minds on the things of the flesh, but those who live 

according to the Spirit, the things of the Spirit. 

6 For to be carnally minded is death, but to be spiritually 
minded is life and peace. 

7 Because the carnal mind is enmity against God; for it is 
not subject to the law of God, nor indeed can be. 



Romans 8:12

12 Therefore, brethren, we are debtors — not to the flesh, 
to live according to the flesh. 

______________________

12 So then, brethren, we are debtors, but not to the flesh 
[we are not obligated to our carnal nature], to live [a life 

ruled by the standards set up by the dictates] of the 
flesh. [AMP]

______________________

12 So, dear brothers and sisters, you have no obligation 
whatsoever to do what your sinful nature urges you to 

do.  [NLT]



Galatians 6:7-9

7 Do not be deceived, God is not mocked; for whatever a 
man sows, that he will also reap. 

8 For he who sows to his flesh will of the flesh reap 
corruption, but he who sows to the Spirit will of the Spirit 

reap everlasting life. 

9 And let us not grow weary while doing good, for in due 
season we shall reap if we do not lose heart.



Resisting The Devil



James 4:7-10

7 Therefore submit to God. Resist the devil and he will 
flee from you. 

8 Draw near to God and He will draw near to you. Cleanse 
your hands, you sinners; and purify your hearts, you 

double-minded. 

9 Lament and mourn and weep! Let your laughter be 
turned to mourning and your joy to gloom. 

10 Humble yourselves in the sight of the Lord, and He 
will lift you up. 



2 Corinthians 7:9-11

9 Now I rejoice, not that you were made sorry, but that your 
sorrow led to repentance. For you were made sorry in a 

godly manner, that you might suffer loss from us in 
nothing. 

10 For godly sorrow produces repentance leading to 
salvation, not to be regretted; but the sorrow of the world 

produces death. 

11 For observe this very thing, that you sorrowed in a godly 
manner: What diligence it produced in you, what clearing of 

yourselves, what indignation, what fear, what vehement 
desire, what zeal, what vindication! In all things you proved 

yourselves to be clear in this matter.



1 Peter 5:6-10

6 Therefore humble yourselves under the mighty hand of 
God, that He may exalt you in due time, 7 casting all your 

care upon Him, for He cares for you. 

8 Be sober, be vigilant; because your adversary the devil 
walks about like a roaring lion, seeking whom he may 

devour. 

9 Resist him, steadfast in the faith, knowing that the same 
sufferings are experienced by your brotherhood in the 

world. 10 But may the God of all grace, who called us to 
His eternal glory by Christ Jesus, after you have suffered a 

while, perfect, establish, strengthen, and settle you.



Loving People



Luke 6:41-42

41 And why do you look at the speck in your brother's 
eye, but do not perceive the plank in your own eye?  

42 Or how can you say to your brother, 'Brother, let me 
remove the speck that is in your eye,' when you yourself 
do not see the plank that is in your own eye? Hypocrite! 
First remove the plank from your own eye, and then you 

will see clearly to remove the speck that is in your 
brother's eye. 



Colossians 3:12-16

12 Therefore, as the elect of God, holy and beloved, put 
on tender mercies, kindness, humility, meekness, 

longsuffering; 

13 bearing with one another, and forgiving one another, if 
anyone has a complaint against another; even as Christ 

forgave you, so you also must do.  

14 But above all these things put on love, which is the 
bond of perfection. 

15 And let the peace of God rule in your hearts, to which 
also you were called in one body; and be thankful. 



2 Corinthians 5:16-19

16 Therefore, from now on, we regard no one according 
to the flesh. Even though we have known Christ 

according to the flesh, yet now we know Him thus no 
longer. 

17 Therefore, if anyone is in Christ, he is a new creation; 
old things have passed away; behold, all things have 

become new. 

18 Now all things are of God, who has reconciled us to 
Himself through Jesus Christ, and has given us the 

ministry of reconciliation, 

19 that is, that God was in Christ reconciling the world to 
Himself, not imputing their trespasses to them, and has 

committed to us the word of reconciliation. 



1 John 4:19

19 We love Him because He first loved us. 
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The End


